
RISK MATRIX - PEREGRINE FORESIGHT

IMPACT

1 Negligible

Minor disruption to activities which has no impact on the overall trip (eg: 
small loss of money, short delay.)  Can be dealt with by the traveller with no 
additional support.  No media interest.

2 Minor
Minor injury or ill health.  Minor disruption to trip activities.  May require the 
support of insurers or the TMC but routine issue.

3 Moderate

Injury or ill health requireing medical treatment.  Loss of critical equipment 
or data.  Significant disruption to the trip itinerary.  May generate minor 
media attention.  Traveller's department and University wil be required to 
support the recovery.

4 Major

Loss of life or serious injury requiring hospitalisation.  Requires immediate 
cancellation of trip activities.  Major disruption to the research/project, 
requiring a long recovery period.  Local media coverage. University travel 
crisis management plan required to support recovery.

5 Critical

Numerous loss of lives or life threatening injuries, prolonged detention or 
captivity.  Emergency evacuation required.  Signifcant damage to the 
University's credibility or ontegrity.  Complete loss of ability to continue with 
research / project.  National media coverage.  Activation of University travel 
crisis management plan.

LIKLIHOOD

1 Rare
A highly unlikely event; it would be very surprising if it happened.  There 
would have to be a combination of unlikely events for this to happen.

2 Unlikely

An unlikely event that remains a possibility under normal circumstances (eg: 
it could occur if a traveller was particularly unlucky or naïve but would 
usually be prevented by the usual travel safety awareness.)

3 Possible

An event which has a reasonable chance of happening (eg: incidents usually 
occur once or twice a year but are not routine and the traveller profile has no 
specific vulnerability.)

4 Likely

An event which has a high probaility of occurring (eg: it happens every few 
months or recent warnings have been issued, and/or the traveller profile 
could be a target.)

5
Almost 
Certain

An event which will occur or is highly likely to happen without specific action 
being taken (eg: it happens frequently in that region, is expected to occur, 
and/or the travellers profile has a high vulnerability to targeted threats.)

OVERALL

(1-4) Insignificant
Minimal levels of risk which do not require additional precautions.  Approved 
at Departmental level

(5-9) Low
Minor levels of risk which can be managed by general travel safety measures.  
Approved at Departmental level.

(10-14) Moderate

Significant levels of risk which require specific actions by the traveller to 
manage.  Mitigations and precautions should be taken to reduce the risk.  
Approved at Departmental level.

(15-19) High

High levels of risk which require very careful planning to determine 
precautions to reduce or manage these risks.  Must be referred to SARAC for 
review.

20+ Extreme

Extreme levels of risk including potential for loss of life and where very 
careful planning and precautions must be taken to reduce or manage the 
risks.  Must be referred to SARAC for review.


